) R @
gors SR X5
wﬁmc&éc QPR B
TAHRTRE RS

6&3‘% WRONY (FTFET 3DIR) APeons, 2017
(20178 JRRRPCH DFechs Fos3~5)

BT DBAONE WHIOD, 1948, BTOF WT Uowzséé VIORWTY SHNTH BB
2OTN DGO,

QY R, B|OOT FOWWE WVFEBNOMON FIF  TDRRONY  QIODIT, 1948,
(19483 30z wpROD XI) HIT), SHTB SRBJT CWBTNDFTO0T;

QW oS3 MevenE wINZoude JIRFBQY FIoFWT Tk, APOTHOBOOOT B
FTNOOT0Z BHADNITOND, NOTT:-

1 Xo3™ IR =HH TRPoR.- (1) 35 BHIODZTZ), TOF WRPONT  (FI0FEdT
3(3%@@) DA, 2017 SO ﬁdodaa’ﬁéd%.

(2) . 3 3RESe 0N 2TITT),

2. 208¢c [Foen 3d%w@,—§?33’% WERONY PRI, 19483 (1948T  #eoy

w0 XD (Y Ay, =008 Bew  BHACHIBOTL  sudedBTNG) 203
TITETY,~

(i)  (DSc WBTESRTY, “BoawrE BOIMBT TEFAOT BB JBT” 20w JTNUA
"RATOORT  FoWFT  SONVTT TBEA08 TR /0T Q0w mwm‘i
B3RIRIZRY,

(i)  (HBe WBBFOREY, “DOBD, TLTCWNYR,” D00 BJERAYR ‘0w AT
BRTRONRYR," 20w TENTR, B0dRRIITR.

3. 228¢ TIORE IWIR.- HDRY  WHIOHIT  223¢  JFORDY, DV IR
TRTRONNAPR DTOTVITNR” S0 IJBAOR “0W FOIT TRTIOVNRPNOZ FRID VYT
ST3 ©B) AT TRTPCWNYR DFOTWTITNDT” 20w JTBRTI, TS03eEBIITTR,

4. 220 TFEONT STWIA-TRO  UOIODT 220 TJSRTY, N I
TRTDERNPR” D0 IJTRYR “BI), TOIT CRITVONNRYR” D0 JTBRY, BB0dee3TIT:,



2

wdowﬁeéo By FTrNY Beod

BT DRAONT WHIONT, 19483, (19480 B0, WA 11) BoFE3s ooz
OZOWRBY,~
() RDooDs FoFs GONET TEFN0Z BIRRODYT TEFOD WPTOR Femony
TR0D DEVFORTN WHTITNRYIR, gaeéoiraeﬁro@déﬁ; B,
(i) 20(4)Be DI 223 FFONRY VRONY TOFY TOBING, DB, 222
TI0RE HBODY APAT WRSATR, BYDVTS,
- IR TR FRDFYD V[ZHoT BORBRCAT.

SlatelelaficH QNTICODT.



Ztatat @ws Bt

TAONZ ToFTOZT Ty SRRTe DS BPIW, LERRORVIHOY,

<}

Bo3ReTE X CT®
FODFT OSND

Q. TR
FoORNFTEF (T)
TIOFEIT AFOS XY



OHoG

saag THLRONT WHACHDL, 19488 (1948T Feow @ADL Xi) w%s Pon

XX XX XX
20. georish.—(1) AINUS IWFOH), IFO TORFTIVY WORRBI  ZACRHS

DRUB, IR AOFF FeBTN IAF DEHLD TTNRPNOZ FRRD TOTROD [RWRTOOT
TR DJO8 OINYR wFPmo 133¢ Jyded (1)Je YwBTJFRET (V) LOTB 9T ()
DOTT VRODY ©OF OINTYOW BPAT FOATYN WFT 148¢ TFTeT ROHY Aodeee
wc&razseﬁﬁ@ﬁ éz&;jﬁ@ DY 5@:35& DDRRONG 9T 3 gegwcg TOTRORN  DRRT
ROTRODT  FOWOFTY WFWAT 2R FeRONTR, SOTN WP, IFFOIL  FowF 3T
TOTITHYN om@a&g) SOVIID, ©FW FeOT, FTFIT om@aag) VHTOON, VW
TONFE B3N BEFNOZ 3RF |TT To, RFHFTT oﬁm@a&g) VHTOODD), BT AN
TYOIROONT  FOIPHEIIoN VT F FHOBO H[HBRLTON VLT BRODIE oﬁmd@&g)
9ZT LHTHOOD, JeePT SRBWTI.

XX XX XX
(4) 83 TBTRT WROHNY OIPRTe WBFODT), HONT’ [PBT  THTTR) O

cgeﬁmwrﬁmmﬁ BT FRPTIVOCITNG D0W &INOTT, DR ODZ, QAT FBOI
QO3REBTAN DT TRTOCWNYR, S0CTT TOWBI, TOR[SRTOZ ATIEF BTV TITR.

XX XX XX
22. 305y OTEROR owBn.~

(R)  IRFp, NWBRENR, ¥ NIBREANY IOIT BJNFE INOIJRAT  IwRONY
BOF WORPNOZ BRI DRAVODW, VT B VHIODIT  YTLOFNY
©ROLY @IAIN WTWeFT mgé&oé TR mgwmel TOTO0D NPT,

(R) 133¢ TF0RT LRODNY TBAT 0IRFYBE 0PI 9FPT BRHTBALT CTVR)TC
BTBTR, YOYOPRB

- O3de AC3RERT, BT JONWNYNTR DFOTLITDTNIT WBIHNON FOTUN® WORDOT
OPTO N IR CRTPCVNCA  WOIWTDTONTH  &LRIN0T ¥Fwme VBTEOOBLR
do@émﬁéﬁﬁzf%:

TOOB, B T[PORT WEBR oW OTTOLTYN O3RRTE  BCHIOND  DPATY,
TR0dpeoRy 203¢ FFTed wROHY FRe0E IRFDe JTTTRAYYS STWOII AT
gsronde ACTCINT 0STwyTe TOTITT BRTID, BefeYatoloIal :87?636@%35&6%.

220, /ST LITCHPNRY TomSnen mmss QOTNOPNEH.-- 33 HOIDT WP
B0 SR TWRT  C3PTE JODDT  C3PRTE  YOTWOTI, WP VTTR  [PRT
olPRTe  BTEBTT, YVQOPEE 03P, AOSREBWIW, VW IRW  TRTONNVR
QROFWTDTONT 2EYIN0T BORBTONSTY.

XX XX XX

XTFD SNTFHeoON, DFR PG FuE, Bonddedd, &7, wRe , 999-Tdnsd 1000, 83 HwHO, 2017



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
THIRTEENTH SESSION

THE MINIMUM WAGES (KARNATAKA AMENDMENT) BILL, 2017
(L.A. Bill No. 5 of 2017)

A Bill to amend the Minimum Wages Act, 1948 in its application to the
State of Karnataka.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Minimum Wages Act,
1948 (Central Act XI of 1948) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the
Sixty-eighth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Minimum Wages (Karnataka Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 20.- In section 20 of the Minimum Wages
Act, 1948 (Central Act XI of 1948), (herein after referred to as the Principal
Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “not below the rank of Labour
Commissioner”, the words “not below the rank of Assistant Labour

Commissioner” shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “one thousand

rupees” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 22.- In section 22 of the Principal Act for
the words “ which may extend to five hundred rupees” the words “which
shall not be less than five thousand rupees but which may extend to ten
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 22 A.- In section 22A of the Principal Act,
for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” shall
be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Minimum Wages Act, 1948
(Central Act 11 of 1948) in its application to the State of Karnataka in order

to,-

(i) delegate the powers to adjudicate the claims to an officer not

below the rank of Assistant Labour Commissioner; and

(i)  enhance certain penalties under section 20 (4), 22 and 22A and

fines levied.

Hence, the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative

measure.

SANTOSH S LAD
Minister for Labour

S.Murthy
Secretary (I/C)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE

Extract from the Minimum Wages Act, 1948 (Central Act XI of 1948)
XX XX XX

Section 20 - Claims.- (1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
in the Official Gazette, appoint any Commissioner for Workmen's Compensation or
any officer of the Central Government exercising functions as a Labour
Commissioner for any region, or any officer of the State Government not below the
rank or Labour Commissioner or any other officer with experience as a Judge of a
Civil Court or as a stipendiary Magistrate to be the Authority to hear and decide for
any specified area all claims arising out of payment of less than the minimum rates
of wages or in respect of the payment of remuneration for days of rest or for work
done on such days under clause (b) or clause (c) of sub- section (1) of section 13 or
of wages at the overtime rate under section 14, to employees employed or paid in
that area.

XX XX XX

(4) If the authority hearing any application under this section is satisfied
that it was either malicious or vexatious, it may direct that a penalty not exceeding
fifty rupees be paid to the employer by the person presenting the application.

XX XX XX

Section 22. Penalties for certain offences.-- Any employer who--

(a) pays to any employee less than the minimum rates of wages fixed
for that employee's class of work, or less than the amount due to him under
the provisions of this Act; or

(b) contravenes any rule or order made under section 13, shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months,
or with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees, or with both;

Provided that in imposing any fine for an offence under this section,
the Court shall take into consideration the amount of any compensation
already awarded against the accused in any proceedings taken under
section 20.

XX XX XX

22A. General provision for punishment of other offences.-- Any
employer who contravenes any provision of this Act or of any rule or order
made there under shall, if no other penalty is provided for such
contravention by this Act, be punishable with fine which may extend to five
hundred rupees.

XX XX XX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha Unit, Bengaluru 8st february, 2017 P7, W.D.999, Copies 1000



